

EXHIBIT “1”



9205 West Russell Road, Building 3, Suite 240
Las Vegas, NV 89148

Ms. Shelley D. Krohn
1180 N. Town Center Drive
Suite 100
Las Vegas, NV 89144

INVOICE

Invoice # 82
Date: 12/07/2020
Due Upon Receipt

In re Ameri-Dream Realty, LLC (BK-S-15-10110-GS)

Services

Type	Date	Notes	Attorney	Quantity	Rate	Total
Service	12/05/2016	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and analyze proofs of claims to determine if objections should be filed	KO	2.20	\$250.00	\$550.00
Service	12/05/2016	B110 Case Administration: Telephone call with creditor regarding obtaining necessary documentation in the possession of Ameri-Dream Realty so that he could change residences.	JH	0.20	\$325.00	\$65.00
Service	12/14/2016	B110 Case Administration: Update website dedicated to the Ameri-Dream bankruptcy case to include developments in the Debtor's bankruptcy case.	JH	0.50	\$325.00	\$162.50
Service	12/28/2016	B110 Case Administration: Draft Status Report regarding current status of the administration of the Debtor's bankruptcy estate prior to the hearing on the Third Interim Fee Application of Nelson & Houmand	KO	2.10	\$250.00	\$525.00
Service	12/30/2016	B110 Case Administration: Revise Status Report for January 3, 2017 Hearing on Third Interim Application for Compensation of Nelson & Houmand, P.C.	JH	0.70	\$325.00	\$227.50
Service	01/03/2017	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Prepare for Hearing on Third Interim Application for Compensation of Nelson & Houmand, P.C. (1.7); Attend Hearing on Third Interim Application for Compensation of Nelson & Houmand, P.C. (.6); Draft	KO	2.80	\$250.00	\$700.00

Order Granting Third Interim Application for Compensation of Nelson & Houmand, P.C. (.5)						
Service	01/03/2017	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Attend hearing on Third Interim Application for Compensation of Nelson & Houmand, P.C. (0.6); revise Order Granting Third Interim Application for Compensation of Nelson & Houmand, P.C. (0.3).	JH	0.90	\$325.00	\$292.50
Service	01/06/2017	B110 Case Administration: Update Ameri-Dream website to include recent developments in the bankruptcy case.	JH	0.80	\$325.00	\$260.00
Service	01/18/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and analyze proofs of claims in preparation for the filing of claim objections (4.7); Dictation of email to attorney Brown regarding amending proof of claim numbers 173-174, 176-180, 183-189, and 191 (.7)	KO	5.40	\$250.00	\$1,350.00
Service	01/18/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Meeting with Attorney Ortiz regarding the strategy in objecting to proofs of claim.	JH	0.30	\$325.00	\$97.50
Service	01/19/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with One Stop Realty regarding the status of the bankruptcy case and priority of claims filed.	JH	0.30	\$325.00	\$97.50
Service	01/23/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft email to counsel for Peter Banyai regarding the need to amend proofs of claims so they no do not exceed the priority amount allowed under Section 507(a)(4)	KO	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00
Service	01/23/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with Ernest Fleming regarding the status of the bankruptcy case.	JH	0.60	\$325.00	\$195.00
Service	01/26/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with and dictation of to Attorney Perkins regarding the need to amend numerous proof of claims	KO	0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00
Service	01/30/2017	B110 Case Administration: Dictation of email to Garden City Group regarding updating the claims register to note the change of addresses of various claimants.	JH	0.20	\$325.00	\$65.00
Service	01/30/2017	B110 Case Administration: Update website	JH	0.90	\$325.00	\$292.50

		dedicated to the Debtor's bankruptcy case to reflect developments in the federal court action against the insurance carrier.				
Service	01/30/2017	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Review and analyze Reply to Opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment and dictation of email to special counsel regarding the same.	JH	1.70	\$325.00	\$552.50
Service	02/01/2017	B110 Case Administration: Telephone call with Attorney Pierce regarding the status of the bankruptcy case and the claims that he filed on behalf of his creditors.	JH	0.30	\$325.00	\$97.50
Service	02/01/2017	B110 Case Administration: Update website dedicated to the Debtor's bankruptcy case to reflect recent developments in the federal court case against the insurance carrier.	JH	0.70	\$325.00	\$227.50
Service	02/02/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with creditor Myrna Pascua regarding the status of the claims review.	JH	0.20	\$325.00	\$65.00
Service	02/06/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Dictation of email to Attorney Newberry regarding a potential stipulation to resolve the trustee's informal objections raised regarding Proof of Claims No. 555-558, and 896	KO	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00
Service	02/07/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Dictation of email to the Garden City Group regarding the filing of amended proofs of claim.	JH	0.30	\$325.00	\$97.50
Service	02/08/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft Stipulation to Resolve Trustee's Objection to Proofs of Claims 555-558, and 896	KO	1.10	\$250.00	\$275.00
Service	02/09/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with creditor Mabella Medrano regarding the status of the bankruptcy case and the claims review	KO	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00
Service	02/17/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Dictation of email to Garden City Group regarding the change of address of various creditors	KO	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00
Service	02/20/2017	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Revise First Interim Application for Compensation of Paul M. Healey, Ltd. and declarations in support of the same.	JH	2.40	\$325.00	\$780.00

Service	02/20/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Revise and edit Stipulation to Resolve Trustee's Objection to Proofs of Claims 555-558, and 896	KO	1.90	\$250.00	\$475.00
Service	02/21/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Revise Stipulation Resolving Objection to Proof of Claim concerning claims filed by Peter Banyai.	JH	0.50	\$325.00	\$162.50
Service	02/21/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Dictation of email to Attorney Newberry regarding a stipulation resolving the Trustee's Objections to Proofs of Claim 555, 556, 557, 558, and 896	KO	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00
Service	02/21/2017	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Finalize First Interim Application for Compensation of Paul M. Healey, CPA and declarations in support of the same.	JH	1.10	\$325.00	\$357.50
Service	02/22/2017	B110 Case Administration: Telephone call with creditor Dan Weaver regarding the status of the bankruptcy case	KO	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00
Service	03/08/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Dictation of email to Attorney Newberry regarding the stipulation to resolve the Trustee's Objections to Proofs of Claim 555, 556, 557, 558, and 896	KO	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00
Service	03/28/2017	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Prepare for and attend hearing on First Interim Application for Compensation of Paul M. Healey & Sons, CPAs, Ltd. (1.7) revise and finalize Order Granting First Interim Application for Compensation of Paul M. Healey & Sons, CPAs, Ltd. (0.4).	JH	2.10	\$325.00	\$682.50
Service	03/29/2017	B110 Case Administration: Telephone call with Accountant Healey regarding the filing of tax returns on behalf of the Debtor's bankruptcy estate.	JH	0.80	\$325.00	\$260.00
Service	03/30/2017	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Dictation of email to Accountant Healey regarding the entry of an order granting his first interim fee application.	JH	0.20	\$325.00	\$65.00
Service	04/11/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Dictation of email to Attorney Newberry regarding the Stipulation Resolving the Trustee's Objections to Proofs of Claims filed by Peter Banyai (.2); Draft Order Approving Stipulation Resolving the Trustee's Objections to Proofs of Claims filed by Peter Banyai (.7)	KO	0.90	\$250.00	\$225.00

Service	04/11/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise Stipulation Resolving Objections to Claim Numbers 555, 556, 557, and 558 and order approving the same.	JH	0.40	\$325.00	\$130.00
Service	04/14/2017	B110 Case Administration: Telephone call with creditor Myrna Pasqua regarding the status of the bankruptcy case(.3);Dictation of email to Garden City Group regarding updating the claims register to note the change of addresses of various claimants.(.2)	KO	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00
Service	04/19/2017	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with creditor Kenneth Bell regarding the status of the bankruptcy case and the litigation against the insurance carrier in federal district court	KO	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00
Service	04/24/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with claimant Mabella Medreno regarding Trustee's objections to proofs of claim numbers 103 and 104 (.2); Telephone call with claimant Esperanza Samilin regarding Trustee's objections to proofs of claim numbers 234, 235, and 236 (.3); Draft Stipulation and Order Resolving Trustee's Objections to proofs of claim numbers 234, 235, and 236 (1.6); Dictation of email to claimant Esperanza Samilin regarding the stipulation resolving objections to proofs of claims numbers 234, 235, and 236 (.3)	KO	2.40	\$250.00	\$600.00
Service	04/26/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with claimant Mabella Medrano regarding Trustee's objections to proofs of claim numbers 103 and 104 (.1); Draft stipulation and order resolving trustee's objections to proof of claims number 103 and 104(2.3); Dictation of email to claimant Mabella Medreno regarding the stipulation resolving the Trustee's objections to proofs of claim numbers 103 and 104(.3); Telephone call with claimant Mabella Medrano regarding the terms of the stipulation (.1)	KO	2.80	\$250.00	\$700.00
Service	05/03/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with Creditor Graig Couton regarding the status of the bankruptcy case (.3); Dictation of email to Garden City Group regarding the change of address for Creditor Graig Couton (.2)	KO	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00
Service	05/16/2017	B110 Case Administration: Update website	JH	1.20	\$325.00	\$390.00

		dedicated to providing notice to creditors with additional information concerning the administration of the Debtor's bankruptcy case.				
Service	05/23/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with creditor Esperanza Samilin regarding status of stipulation resolving objections to claims	KO	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00
Service	05/23/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with claimant Esperanza Samilin regarding the stipulation to resolve objections to proofs of claim (.3); Dictation of email to Garden City Group regarding updated address for Esperanza Samilin (.1); Revise Stipulation with claimant Esperanza Samilin to Resolve objections to proofs of claim (.3)	KO	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00
Service	05/23/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with Claimant Myrna Pascua regarding the status of the bankruptcy case and stipulating to resolve the Trustee's objection to her proof of claim (.2); Draft stipulation and order resolving Trustee's objection to Pascua proof of claim (1.8); Review claims 910, 912, and 913 (.2); Dictation of email to Attorney Newberry regarding the Trustee's objections to claims 910, 912, and 913 (.4); Telephone call with claimant Chau regarding the status of the bankruptcy case and stipulating to resolve the Trustee's objection to claims 722, 733, and 734 (.4); Dictation of email to Garden City Group regarding updated address for claimant Chau (.1)	KO	3.10	\$250.00	\$775.00
Service	05/23/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Revise Stipulation Resolving Objection to Proof of Claim 145.	JH	0.30	\$325.00	\$97.50
Service	05/23/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft Stipulation and Order Resolving Objections to Proofs of Claim Numbers 910, 912, and 913(1.7) Dictation of email to Attorney Newberry regarding Stipulation Resolving Objections to Proofs of Claim Numbers 910,911, and 913(.1); Draft Stipulation and Order Resolving Objections to Proofs of Claim Number 722, 733, and 734 (1.5)	KO	3.30	\$250.00	\$825.00
Service	06/06/2017	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with claimant Mabella Medrano regarding the Notice of Entry of Order and the status of the	KO	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00

bankruptcy case						
Service	06/09/2017	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with Claimant Fleming regarding the status of the bankruptcy case	KO	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00
Service	07/17/2017	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with claimant Myrna Pascua regarding the status of the bankruptcy case and the notice of entry of order approving the stipulation resolving the trustee's objection to Pascual's proof of claim	KO	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00
Service	10/06/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with claimant Suzette Cruz involving the status of the bankruptcy case (.2); Dictation of email to Suzette Cruz regarding documentation needed associated with her proof of claim (.2)	KO	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00
Service	10/12/2017	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Telephone call with Attorney Ortiz regarding the recent ruling granting the motion to dismiss in the litigation against the insurance company.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	10/12/2017	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Telephone call with Attorney Schwartz regarding the District Court's recent decision regarding the Trustee's Motion for Summary Judgment against the Debtor's insurance carrier and case strategy moving forward (.5); Telephone call with Attorney Houmand regarding the recent ruling on the Trustee's Motion for Summary Judgment against the Debtor's insurance carrier (.4)	KO	0.90	\$275.00	\$247.50
Service	10/13/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Conference call regarding the remaining objections that need to be filed to the proofs of claim filed in the Debtor's bankruptcy case.	JH	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	10/16/2017	B110 Case Administration: Review recent court filings and prepare information to update website dedicated to providing information to the Debtor's creditors.	JH	1.60	\$350.00	\$560.00
Service	10/16/2017	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Review and analyze Order Granting Motion to Dismiss and First Amended Complaint in the Nelson v. XL America lawsuit and dictation of email	JH	1.80	\$350.00	\$630.00

		to Trustee regarding the same.				
Service	10/17/2017	B110 Case Administration: Draft Notice of Change of Address and Change of Firm Name	KO	0.70	\$275.00	\$192.50
Service	10/23/2017	B110 Case Administration: Draft email to claims agent regarding the extension of the use of the mailbox.	JH	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/24/2017	B110 Case Administration: Draft email to claims agent regarding the extension of the time for a mailbox for the proofs of claim.	JH	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	11/08/2017	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Meeting with Attorney Ortiz regarding the remaining group of proof of claims that need to be resolved.	JH	1.10	\$350.00	\$385.00
Service	11/27/2017	B110 Case Administration: Draft memorandum providing the Chapter 7 Trustee with an update regarding the status of the case	KO	0.70	\$275.00	\$192.50
Service	12/12/2017	B120 Asset Analysis and Recovery: Conference call with Chapter 7 Trustee regarding status of bankruptcy case.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	01/04/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with Attorney Ortiz regarding obtaining authority from the Chapter 7 Trustee to resolve proofs of claim that fall under the same objection category.	JH	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	01/11/2018	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Draft email to special litigation counsel regarding the status of litigation commenced against the insurance carrier.	JH	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	01/17/2018	B110 Case Administration: Draft memorandum updating the successor trustee on the status of the bankruptcy case.	KO	0.70	\$275.00	\$192.50
Service	01/18/2018	B110 Case Administration: Review and revise memorandum regarding case status to be sent to the successor trustee.	JH	0.90	\$350.00	\$315.00
Service	01/22/2018	B110 Case Administration: Revise memorandum to Chapter 7 Trustee regarding the status of the bankruptcy case.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	02/12/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Meeting with Attorney Ortiz regarding remaining claim objections that	JH	0.80	\$350.00	\$280.00

		need to be filed.				
Service	02/13/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Meeting with Chapter 7 Trustee regarding the status of the administration of the bankruptcy case and the objections that need to be filed to the proofs of claim.	JH	1.50	\$350.00	\$525.00
Service	02/27/2018	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with Myrna Pascua regarding the status of the bankruptcy case and federal court litigation	KO	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00
Service	03/05/2018	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft Ex Parte Application Employ Houmand Law Firm for Successor Trustee and related pleadings.	JH	3.30	\$350.00	\$1,155.00
Service	03/12/2018	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Review and revise Ex Parte Application to Employ Houmand Law Firm for Successor Trustee and pleadings in support thereof	KO	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00
Service	03/13/2018	B110 Case Administration: Update website dedicated to provide creditors with information related to the Debtor's bankruptcy case.	JH	0.80	\$350.00	\$280.00
Service	03/19/2018	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Finalize Ex Parte Application to Employ Houmand Law Firm and pleadings in support of the same.	JH	0.80	\$350.00	\$280.00
Service	04/10/2018	B110 Case Administration: Draft email to technician regarding updates to website dedicated to case developments.	JH	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	04/18/2018	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with claimant Kenneth Bell regarding the status of the bankruptcy case	KO	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00
Service	05/10/2018	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with counsel for claimants Vincent and Maria Godino regarding the status of the bankruptcy case	KO	0.30	\$275.00	\$82.50
Service	05/14/2018	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with claimant Greg Couchon regarding status of the bankruptcy case	KO	0.10	\$275.00	\$27.50
Service	05/22/2018	B110 Case Administration: Telephone call with representative of claimant Capitola, LLC regarding a change of address and the status of the bankruptcy case (.3); Dictation of email to Garden City Group regarding	KO	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00

		the change of address for Capitola, LLC (.1)				
Service	05/29/2018	B110 Case Administration: Update website dedicated to developments in the Debtor's bankruptcy case.	JH	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/07/2018	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Telephone call with special litigation counsel regarding the status of the litigation against the insurance carrier.	JH	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/08/2018	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Telephone call with Attorney Ortiz regarding the Order Denying the Motion for Leave to Amend that was entered by the District Court in the case against the insurance carrier.	JH	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/26/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft email to Garden City Group regarding a total of the proofs of claim that have been filed in the Debtor's bankruptcy case to assist with the preparation of a motion to establish procedures concerning objection to proofs of claim (0.2); draft Motion to Establish Procedures for Objection to Claims and declaration in support of the same (2.9).	JH	3.10	\$350.00	\$1,085.00
Service	06/27/2018	B110 Case Administration: Prepare memorandum updating the Chapter 7 Trustee on the status of the bankruptcy case.	JH	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	07/02/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Conference call with Chapter 7 Trustee regarding the status of claim objections.	JH	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	07/26/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft Objection to Proof of Claim 31 as duplicative of Claim 780 filed by landlord	KO	2.20	\$275.00	\$605.00
Service	07/27/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise Objection to Proof of Claim 31 and telephone call with Attorney Ortiz regarding the same.	JH	0.80	\$350.00	\$280.00
Service	07/30/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise Objection to Proof of Claim 31 and 780.	JH	1.10	\$350.00	\$385.00
Service	07/30/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft Objection to Proof of	KO	2.30	\$275.00	\$632.50

Claim 780 for improperly claiming priority under Section 507(a)(7)						
Service	07/30/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Dictation of email to Chapter 7 Trustee regarding the Objections to Proofs of Claims 780 and 31	KO	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00
Service	08/16/2018	B110 Case Administration: Update website dedicated to developments in the Debtor's bankruptcy case.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	08/30/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Attend hearing on Objection to Proofs of Claim.	JH	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	08/30/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Prepare for and attend hearing on Objection to Claims 31 and 780	KO	1.50	\$275.00	\$412.50
Service	08/31/2018	B110 Case Administration: Draft email to Chapter 7 Trustee regarding the basis for the turnover of security deposits to the bankruptcy estate in order to assist with an audit conducted by the U.S. Trustee.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	08/31/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft orders regarding Objections to Claim 31 and 780	KO	1.60	\$275.00	\$440.00
Service	09/04/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise Orders relating to Objections to Proofs of Claim.	JH	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	09/05/2018	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Finalize Orders On Objection to Claims 31 and 780	KO	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00
Service	10/08/2018	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Review and revise settlement agreement with XL Insurance.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	10/16/2018	B120 Asset Analysis and Recovery: Conference call with Chapter 7 Trustee regarding the status of the administration of the Debtor's bankruptcy case.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	11/01/2018	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Draft email to special counsel regarding the status of the finalization of the settlement agreement with XL Insurance.	JH	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	11/02/2018	B120 Asset Analysis and Recovery: Draft email to special counsel regarding revisions to the settlement agreement suggested by the insurance carrier.	JH	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00

Service	11/13/2018	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Review and revise Motion to Approve Compromise with XL Insurance and pleadings in support	KO	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00
Service	11/14/2018	B110 Case Administration: Draft email to Chapter 7 Trustee regarding status of the various litigation cases that have been commenced against the Debtor's principal and the insurance companies.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	11/27/2018	B110 Case Administration: Draft email to accountant regarding the status of the bankruptcy case, the amount of funds that were embezzled by the Debtor's principal, and the objection to proofs of claim.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	11/29/2018	B110 Case Administration: Draft emails to special counsel and accountant regarding the ownership of the Debtor and the marital status of John and Elsie Brown.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	12/15/2018	B110 Case Administration: Review invoices submitted by Garden City Group in order to reconcile amounts paid during the administration of the bankruptcy case.	JH	1.20	\$350.00	\$420.00
Service	12/17/2018	B110 Case Administration: Finalize accounting of the payments that have been made to Garden City Group to ensure that there has not been a double-payment.	JH	1.10	\$350.00	\$385.00
Service	01/09/2019	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Draft emails to special counsel and the Trustee regarding the procedure for depositing settlement funds from the insurance carrier.	JH	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	01/15/2019	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Review First and Final Application for Compensation filed by Special Counsel and draft email to Chapter 7 Trustee regarding the same.	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	01/29/2019	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with Creditor Dan Weaver regarding status of bankruptcy case	KO	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
Service	02/25/2019	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Telephone call with Claimant Myrna Pascua regarding status of bankruptcy case	KO	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
Service	04/04/2019	B110 Case Administration: Telephone call with Accountant Healey regarding the tax implications of paying the realtors that have	JH	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00

		filed proofs of claim in the Debtor's bankruptcy case.				
Service	05/08/2019	B110 Case Administration: Telephone call with Kenneth Bell regarding the status of the bankruptcy case.	JH	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/07/2019	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with creditor regarding the status of the case.	JH	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	02/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft pleadings associated with Ex Parte Motion to Authorize Joinder of Proofs of Claim Pursuant to FRBP 3007(c).	JH	2.90	\$350.00	\$1,015.00
Service	02/07/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Finalize pleadings associated with the Ex Parte Motion to Authorize Joinder of Claim Objections (0.6); draft Status Report prior to February 20, 2020 Status Hearing (1.4).	JH	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
Service	03/03/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and analyze claims spreadsheet and plan omnibus objection to claims based by landlords based on security deposits.	BS	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	03/04/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise omnibus objection to claims based on real estate commissions.	BS	3.20	\$350.00	\$1,120.00
Service	03/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue drafting omnibus objection to claims claiming priority based on real estate commission	BS	2.10	\$350.00	\$735.00
Service	03/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise trustee's declaration	BS	0.80	\$350.00	\$280.00
Service	03/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue drafting and revising first omnibus objection to claims.	BS	1.60	\$350.00	\$560.00
Service	03/09/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise second omnibus objection to claim.	BS	6.80	\$350.00	\$2,380.00
Service	03/12/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue drafting second omnibus objection to claim.	BS	5.20	\$350.00	\$1,820.00
Service	03/13/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise third omnibus objection to claim.	BS	5.80	\$350.00	\$2,030.00

Service	03/16/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue drafting third omnibus objection to claim.	BS	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	03/19/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise fourth omnibus objection to claims.	BS	4.80	\$350.00	\$1,680.00
Service	03/20/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise third and fourth Omnibus claim objections.	BS	5.00	\$350.00	\$1,750.00
Service	03/23/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continued draft and revision of omnibus claim objections.	BS	8.90	\$350.00	\$3,115.00
Service	03/24/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft Trustee's declarations in support of second, and third omnibus motion. Complete third and fourth omnibus motion rough drafts.	BS	6.50	\$350.00	\$2,275.00
Service	03/30/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Compile claims, review for duplicates and exclude claims which do not meet criteria for omnibus objections.	BS	3.00	\$350.00	\$1,050.00
Service	04/02/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review claims 1-180 for claims which lack documentation and notate for Eighth omnibus objection to claims.	BS	1.30	\$350.00	\$455.00
Service	04/03/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and analyze remaining 800 claims and determine if documentation appropriate and notate claims where documentation is insufficient.	BS	7.10	\$350.00	\$2,485.00
Service	04/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise eighth omnibus objection to claim.	BS	2.40	\$350.00	\$840.00
Service	04/09/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and analyze claims register and accompanying claim (952 claims) and determine claims which improperly assert secured claim.	BS	4.10	\$350.00	\$1,435.00
Service	04/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Ninth Omnibus objection to Claim.	BS	2.30	\$350.00	\$805.00
Service	04/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Trustee's declaration in support of ninth omnibus claim objections.	BS	0.70	\$350.00	\$245.00
Service	04/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and	BS	1.80	\$350.00	\$630.00

		Objections: Draft and revise tenth Omnibus Claim objections.				
Service	04/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Trustee's declaration in support of tenth omnibus claim objection.	BS	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	04/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Create claim spreadsheet to track which claim was objected to in which Omnibus motion and to assist in determining duplicate claims. Input list of claims from each objection into spreadsheet.	BS	0.80	\$350.00	\$280.00
Service	04/16/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft and revises second fee application for Paul Healey and associated documents.	BS	2.50	\$350.00	\$875.00
Service	04/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Confer with J. Houmand regarding filing of claim objections, possible motion to establish procedures, timing of filing.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	04/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review local rule on claim objections, determine whether claims need to be attached to motion and standard on omnibus motion.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	04/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review proofs of claims, claims register, and and claim notes, for duplicate claims, and competing landlord/tenant priority claims.	BS	6.10	\$350.00	\$2,135.00
Service	04/21/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft and revise certificate of service for fee application.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	04/23/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Prepare documents for service, reduce documents and send documents to server.	BS	0.60	\$350.00	\$210.00
Service	04/23/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft, revise, and file certificate of service.	BS	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	05/11/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise motion to establish procedures for omnibus claim objection.	BS	2.40	\$350.00	\$840.00
Service	05/22/2020	B310 Claims Administration and	JH	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00

Objections: Review and revise Order Sustaining Objection to First Omnibus Objection to Proofs of Claim.						
Service	05/22/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Plan and prepare for Hearing on Application to Pay Paul Healey.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	05/22/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Plan and prepare for Hearing on First Omnibus Claim objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	05/22/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Attend hearing on application to employ Paul Healey.	BS	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
Service	05/22/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Attend hearing on first omnibus claim objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	05/22/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft order granting first omnibus objection.	BS	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	05/22/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Advise client as to outcome on claim objections	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/01/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order Granting First Omnibus Objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/01/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order granting second interim fee application of Paul Healey.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/02/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft certificates of service for notice of entry of order for first omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/02/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft certificate of service for notice of entry of order for second interim fee application of Paul Healey.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Research case law on competing claimants on the same debt.	BS	2.10	\$350.00	\$735.00
Service	06/09/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise pleadings for eleventh omnibus objection to claims.	BS	6.10	\$350.00	\$2,135.00
Service	06/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with Attorney Sims regarding the filing of the remaining	JH	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00

Omnibus Objections to Proofs of Claim.						
Service	06/12/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue to draft and revise eleventh omnibus objection to claims.	BS	7.40	\$350.00	\$2,590.00
Service	06/15/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Finish draft and revision of eleventh omnibus objection.	BS	6.00	\$350.00	\$2,100.00
Service	06/15/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise twelfth omnibus objection to claim.	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
Service	06/16/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Revise omnibus objections two through eight to adjust for claims objected to on other grounds.	BS	3.00	\$350.00	\$1,050.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft motions to exceed page length limit for omnibus objections two.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise motion to exceed page length limit for omnibus objection three.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise motion to exceed page length limit for omnibus objection four.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise motion to exceed page length limit for omnibus objection five.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise motion to exceed page length limit for omnibus objection six.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise motion to exceed page length limit for omnibus objection nine.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of hearing for omnibus claim objection two.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of hearing for omnibus claim objection three.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00

		hearing for omnibus claim objection four.				
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of hearing for omnibus claim objection five.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of hearing for omnibus claim objection six.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of hearing for omnibus claim objection seven.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of hearing for omnibus claim objection eight.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of hearing for omnibus claim objection nine.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	06/22/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Prepare exhibit table for second omnibus motion (97 exhibits)	BS	2.40	\$350.00	\$840.00
Service	06/22/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Prepare exhibit table for third omnibus motion (99 exhibits)	BS	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
Service	06/22/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Prepare exhibit table for fourth omnibus motion (99 exhibits)	BS	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
Service	06/30/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with real estate agent regarding the status of the administration of the Debtor's bankruptcy case.	JH	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	07/02/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Update website to include additional information to be uploaded to the firm website.	JH	1.90	\$350.00	\$665.00
Service	07/02/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise pleadings related to the Second and Third Omnibus Objections to Proofs of Claim.	JH	2.70	\$350.00	\$945.00
Service	07/02/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review case file and prepare service list for second omnibus objection.	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
Service	07/02/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review case file and prepare service list for third omnibus objection.	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00

Service	07/02/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Communicate with client regarding second and third omnibus objections.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	07/02/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Omnibus objection to late filed claims.	BS	2.60	\$350.00	\$910.00
Service	07/03/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue revision of Fifth Omnibus Objection regarding improper priority claims, and compilation of exhibits.	BS	2.40	\$350.00	\$840.00
Service	07/03/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue revision of fourth Omnibus Objection regarding improper priority claims, and compilation of exhibits.	BS	2.10	\$350.00	\$735.00
Service	07/07/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Revise pleadings related to Fourth and Fifth Omnibus Objections to Proofs of Claim.	JH	2.20	\$375.00	\$825.00
Service	07/07/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Make final corrections to pleadings associated with Second Omnibus Objection and prepare for filing.	BS	0.90	\$350.00	\$315.00
Service	07/07/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Make final corrections to pleadings associated with Third Omnibus Objection and prepare for filing.	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
Service	07/07/2020	B110 Case Administration: Update website to include additional documents that were filed in the Debtor's bankruptcy case.	JH	0.50	\$375.00	\$187.50
Service	07/07/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: File second omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	07/07/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: File third omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	07/07/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Communicate with garden city regarding effectuating service of process on second and third omnibus objections.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	07/07/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue draft and revise sixth omnibus objection including assembling exhibits and service list.	BS	2.40	\$350.00	\$840.00
Service	07/08/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Finish draft and revise sixth omnibus objection including assembling exhibits and service list.	BS	1.90	\$350.00	\$665.00

Service	07/09/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Communicate with service of process company regarding progress of service.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	07/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft email to Epiq regarding the service of the Second and Third Omnibus Objections.	JH	0.20	\$375.00	\$75.00
Service	07/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Telephone call with creditors regarding the status of the bankruptcy case.	JH	0.20	\$375.00	\$75.00
Service	07/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue revision of Omnibus Objection regarding competing landlord tenant claims, and compilation of exhibits.	BS	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	07/10/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise objection to claim 857-1	BS	2.10	\$350.00	\$735.00
Service	07/14/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Complete draft of objection to secured claims and accompanying documents including exhibits and service list.	BS	2.50	\$350.00	\$875.00
Service	07/14/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Complete draft of objection to priority/secured claims (split claims) and accompanying documents including exhibits and service list.	BS	2.10	\$350.00	\$735.00
Service	07/16/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise omnibus objection to duplicate claims, including compiling exhibits and service list.	BS	2.80	\$350.00	\$980.00
Service	07/21/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue revision of Omnibus Objection regarding competing landlord tenant claims, and compilation of exhibits.	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
Service	07/21/2020	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Communicate with claimant regarding status of case and anticipated timeline of distributions.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	07/23/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue revision of Omnibus Objection regarding competing landlord tenant claims, and compilation of exhibits.	BS	1.10	\$350.00	\$385.00
Service	07/24/2020	B110 Case Administration: Draft	JH	0.40	\$375.00	\$150.00

memorandum updating Chapter 7 Trustee on the status of the bankruptcy case.						
Service	07/27/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Complete revision of Omnibus Objection regarding landlord tenant claim, and compilation of exhibits and service list.	BS	3.10	\$350.00	\$1,085.00
Service	07/27/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Communicate with epiqglobal regarding service of Omnibus Objections 4 and 5.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	07/28/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order on motion to exceed page limit for fourth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	07/28/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order on motion to exceed page limit for fifth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	08/04/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise certificate of service for Fourth Omnibus Objection	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	08/04/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise certificate of service for Fifth Omnibus Objection	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	08/04/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Revise Eighth Omnibus objection, compile exhibits and service list.	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
Service	08/11/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise thirteenth omnibus objection, compile exhibits, service list.	BS	2.60	\$350.00	\$910.00
Service	08/11/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review claims register and exemptions to date and determine whether further claim objections are needed.	BS	2.60	\$350.00	\$910.00
Service	08/12/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Revise Twelfth objection and complete accompanying exhibits and documents.	BS	1.40	\$350.00	\$490.00
Service	08/12/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise fourteenth omnibus objection, compile exhibits, service list.	BS	2.50	\$350.00	\$875.00
Service	08/12/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue review of claims objections and claims register and	BS	1.70	\$350.00	\$595.00

		determine whether additional claim objections needed.				
Service	08/13/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise pleadings associated with Omnibus Objections Six through Eight.	JH	2.10	\$375.00	\$787.50
Service	08/13/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Appear for/attend hearing on Omnibus Objections 2 and 3.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	08/13/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Provide update on claim objections to client and request declarations in support of further objections.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	08/13/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Revise Trustee's seventh omnibus objection to include additional, omitted claims.	BS	2.10	\$350.00	\$735.00
Service	08/14/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise Ninth and Tenth Omnibus Objections to Proofs of Claim.	JH	1.20	\$375.00	\$450.00
Service	08/14/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Communicate regarding declarations for Omnibus objections nine and ten.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	08/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise objection to Claim 16-1	BS	1.10	\$350.00	\$385.00
Service	08/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise objection to Claim 98-1	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
Service	08/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft notice of entry of order granting motion to exceed page limit (Sixth Omnibus).	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	08/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft notice of entry of order granting motion to exceed page limit (Ninth Omnibus).	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	08/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft notice of entry of order sustaining objection (Second Omnibus).	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	08/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft notice of entry of order sustaining objection (Third Omnibus).	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00

Service	08/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise objection to Claim 824-1	BS	1.10	\$350.00	\$385.00
Service	08/18/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise pleadings associated with the eleventh through fourteenth omnibus objections to proofs of claim.	JH	3.70	\$375.00	\$1,387.50
Service	08/19/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise certificate of service of Objection to Claim 857-1.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	08/19/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise certificate of service of Thirteenth Omnibus Objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	08/19/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise certificate of service of Fourteenth Omnibus Objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	08/19/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise certificate of service of Eleventh Omnibus Objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	08/19/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise certificate of service of Twelfth Omnibus Objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	08/19/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise certificate of service of Objection to Claim 98-1.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	08/19/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise certificate of service of Objection to Claim 824-1.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	08/24/2020	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Communicate with G. Hawkins regarding objection to claim.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	08/24/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Communicate with E. Fleming regarding status of case and claim objection.	BS	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	09/03/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Plan and prepare for hearings on fourth and fifth omnibus objections.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	09/03/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Appear at and attend hearings on fourth and fifth omnibus objections.	BS	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	09/03/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Communicate with G Couton regarding objection to claim 98-1.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00

Service	09/03/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Communicate with G. Couton regarding claim objection.	BS	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	09/08/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order granting fourth omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	09/08/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order granting fifth omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	09/09/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order granting fifth omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	09/09/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order granting fourth omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	09/14/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Plan and prepare for oral arguments on Omnibus Objections to Claims six through ten.	BS	0.80	\$350.00	\$280.00
Service	09/15/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Plan and prepare for hearings on Omnibus objections 6-10.	BS	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
Service	09/15/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Appear for and attend hearing on Omnibus objections 6-10.	BS	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	09/15/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order granting sixth omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	09/15/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order granting seventh omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	09/15/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order granting eighth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	09/15/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order granting ninth omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	09/15/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order granting tenth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	09/16/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and analyze all claims and cross reference orders, and planned claim objections and determine that all claims are appropriately objected to and no	BS	3.50	\$350.00	\$1,225.00

objections to claims remain.						
Service	09/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order for sixth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	09/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order for seventh omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	09/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order for eighth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	09/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order for ninth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	09/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order for tenth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	09/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order for tenth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	09/17/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Continue final review of claims and objections.	BS	2.30	\$350.00	\$805.00
Service	09/18/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Complete final review of claims and objections.	BS	1.90	\$350.00	\$665.00
Service	09/23/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Research affect of conflicting orders, appropriate resolution of conflicting claim objections.	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
Service	09/28/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise pleadings associated with objection to claim 918.	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
Service	09/30/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise pleadings related to Objection to Claim 918.	JH	0.50	\$375.00	\$187.50
Service	09/30/2020	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions): Draft and revise motion to set aside and associated papers.	BS	2.60	\$350.00	\$910.00
Service	10/01/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Review and revise pleadings associated with Motion to Set Aside Order.	JH	0.90	\$375.00	\$337.50
Service	10/01/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Appear for and attend hearing	BS	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00

on Omnibus Objection to Claims (11-14), and Miscellaneous claim objections.						
Service	10/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order sustaining eleventh omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order sustaining twelfth omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order sustaining thirteenth omnibus objection.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order sustaining fourteenth omnibus objection.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order sustaining objection to claim 16-1.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order sustaining objection to claim 98-1.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order sustaining objection to claim 824-1.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/05/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order sustaining objection to claim 857-1.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/05/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Review and analyze invoices provided by Garden city in preparation for fee application.	BS	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
Service	10/05/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft and revise fee application for Garden City.	BS	2.80	\$350.00	\$980.00
Service	10/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order Sustaining Eleventh Omnibus Objection to Claims.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order Sustaining Twelfth Omnibus Objection to Claims.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order Sustaining Thirteenth Omnibus Objection to Claims.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00

Service	10/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order Sustaining Fourteenth Omnibus Objection to Claims.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order Sustaining Objection to Claim 857.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order Sustaining Objection to Claim 824.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order Sustaining Objection to Claim 16.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/06/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise Notice of Entry of Order Sustaining Objection to Claim 98.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/07/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft and revise third and final fee application of Paul Healey.	BS	2.60	\$350.00	\$910.00
Service	10/08/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Review and revise pleadings associated with Third and Final Fee Application in favor of Paul Healey.	JH	1.20	\$375.00	\$450.00
Service	10/08/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Communicate with garden city regarding invoices for fee application.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/09/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Communicate with S. Perischilli regarding invoices.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/12/2020	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Communicate with M. Medrano regarding status of case and expected timeline of completion.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/13/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft/revise initial draft of final application for compensation for Houmand Law Firm.	BS	2.80	\$350.00	\$980.00
Service	10/14/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Review and finalize pleadings associated with the Application for Compensation in favor of Paul Healey.	JH	0.70	\$375.00	\$262.50
Service	10/14/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Review and revise pleadings associated with Garden City Group fee application.	JH	2.60	\$375.00	\$975.00
Service	10/14/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Communicate with client regarding	BS	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00

		declaration in support of Garden Grove Fee Application.				
Service	10/14/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Communicate with S. Perischilli regarding declaration in support of fee application.	BS	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
Service	10/20/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Revise application for compensation for Paul Healey.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/20/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Revise application for compensation for GCG.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/20/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Communicate with client regarding fee applications.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/29/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Plan and prepare for hearings on claim objections.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/29/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Attend hearings on claim objections.	BS	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
Service	10/29/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order on motion to set aside.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/29/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise order granting objection to claim 918-1.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	10/30/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order granting motion to set aside.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/30/2020	B310 Claims Administration and Objections: Draft and revise notice of entry of order sustaining objection to claim 918.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	10/30/2020	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors: Communicate with M. Pascua regarding status of case.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	11/17/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Plan and prepare for hearing on application for fees, Paul Healey.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	11/17/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Plan and prepare for hearing on application for fees, Garden City Group.	BS	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
Service	11/17/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Attend hearings on fee applications for Garden City Group and Paul Healey.	BS	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00

Service	11/17/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft and revise order granting application for fees of Paul Healey.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	11/17/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft and revise order granting application for fees of Garden City Group.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	11/20/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Revise Order Granting Fee Application in favor of Garden City Group fdba Garden City Group.	JH	0.40	\$375.00	\$150.00
Service	11/20/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Revise Order Approving Compensation in favor of Paul Healey and draft email to Chapter 7 Trustee regarding the same.	JH	0.40	\$375.00	\$150.00
Service	11/30/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft and revise notice of entry of order granting final application for Paul Healey.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	11/30/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Revise Amended Orders Granting Epiq and Healey Fee Applications.	JH	0.90	\$375.00	\$337.50
Service	11/30/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Draft and revise notice of entry of order granting final application for GCG.	BS	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
Service	12/01/2020	B160 Fee/Employment Applications: Revise application for compensation (HLF) and complete draft of associated pleadings.	BS	1.40	\$350.00	\$490.00
Services Subtotal						\$115,657.50

Expenses

Type	Date	Notes	Quantity	Rate	Total
Expense	01/23/2017	E123 Other professionals: Ranking Edge - Invoice related to maintenance of website dedicated to the Debtor's bankruptcy case.	1.00	\$115.99	\$115.99
Expense	02/21/2017	E108 Postage: Postage related to First Interim Application to Pay Paul M. Healey, CPA.	1.00	\$2.40	\$2.40
Expense	03/28/2017	E124 Other: Parking Expenses - Hearing On First Interim Application for Compensation of Paul M. Healey & Sons, CPAs, Ltd.	1.00	\$2.00	\$2.00
Expense	05/23/2017	E108 Postage: Postage related to stipulations with claimants Esperanza Samilin, Myrna Pascau, and Tiffany Hsia Chau	1.00	\$4.20	\$4.20
Expense	06/08/2017	E123 Other professionals: Outside services related to	1.00	\$145.34	\$145.34

Ranking Edge.					
Expense	06/09/2017	E108 Postage: Postage related to mailing of Notice of Entry of Orders Approving Stipulations	1.00	\$4.26	\$4.26
Expense	12/01/2017	E124 Other: Expenses related to Ameri-Dream Realty dedicated website.	1.00	\$110.67	\$110.67
Expense	04/13/2018	E112 Court fees: PACER charges.	1.00	\$66.10	\$66.10
Expense	08/01/2018	E108 Postage: Third-Party Mailing Service for Objection to Proof of Claim 31	1.00	\$22.52	\$22.52
Expense	08/01/2018	E108 Postage: Third-Party Mailing Service for Objection to Proof of Claim 780	1.00	\$8.44	\$8.44
Expense	08/17/2018	E124 Other: Expenses related to maintenance of website dedicated to provide creditors and parties-in-interest with status regarding the bankruptcy case.	1.00	\$148.00	\$148.00
Expense	09/11/2018	E108 Postage: Third Party Mailing Service for Notice of Entry of Orders On Objections to Claim 31 and Claim 780	1.00	\$8.00	\$8.00
Expense	04/21/2020	E108 Postage: Copying, printing, postage, and service of Second Application for fees, Paul Healey.	1.00	\$12.50	\$12.50
Expense	04/23/2020	E108 Postage: Cost of mailing, processing, and postage for First Omnibus claim objection.	1.00	\$210.00	\$210.00
Expense	06/01/2020	E108 Postage: Postage, printing, and processing of notice of entry of order granting first omnibus claim objection.	1.00	\$25.50	\$25.50
Expense	06/02/2020	E108 Postage: Postage, printing, and processing of notice of entry of order on application for fees of Paul Healey	1.00	\$11.25	\$11.25
Expense	08/14/2020	E108 Postage: Postage printing and processing for service of tenth omnibus objection.	1.00	\$24.80	\$24.80
Expense	08/19/2020	E108 Postage: Postage printing and processing for service of objection to claim 857-1	1.00	\$4.05	\$4.05
Expense	08/19/2020	E108 Postage: Postage printing and processing for service of Thirteenth Omnibus Objection.	1.00	\$8.65	\$8.65
Expense	08/19/2020	E108 Postage: Postage printing and processing for service of Fourteenth Omnibus Objection.	1.00	\$13.30	\$13.30
Expense	08/19/2020	E108 Postage: Postage printing and processing for service of Eleventh Omnibus Objection.	1.00	\$20.40	\$20.40
Expense	08/19/2020	E108 Postage: Postage printing and processing for service of Twelfth Omnibus Objection.	1.00	\$49.05	\$49.05
Expense	08/19/2020	E108 Postage: Postage printing and processing for service of objection to claim 16-1.	1.00	\$4.05	\$4.05

Expense	08/19/2020	E108 Postage: Postage printing and processing for service of objection to claim 98-1.	1.00	\$4.05	\$4.05
Expense	08/19/2020	E108 Postage: Postage printing and processing for service of objection to claim 824-1.	1.00	\$4.05	\$4.05
Expense	10/01/2020	E108 Postage: Postage, printing, and processing for Objection to Claim 918.	1.00	\$4.05	\$4.05
				Expenses Subtotal	\$1,033.62
				Subtotal	\$116,691.12
				Total	\$116,691.12

Detailed Statement of Account

Current Invoice

Invoice Number	Due On	Amount Due	Payments Received	Balance Due	
82	12/07/2020	\$116,691.12	\$0.00	\$116,691.12	
				Outstanding Balance	\$116,691.12
				Total Amount Outstanding	\$116,691.12

Please make all amounts payable to: Houmand Law Firm, Ltd.

Payment is due upon receipt.